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BROOKLYN TOWNSHIP. 
Brooklyn township is bounded on the north by the county 

line, on the east by the San Leandro creek and Eden town­
ship, on the south and west by the bay of San Francisco 
and Alameda township and the San Antonio creek. The 
town of Brooklyn or San Antonio, ranks second to Oakland 
in the county. though the Township itself is not second in 
size. From San Antonio to San Leandro the county is oc­
cupied almost exclusively by farmers, although there are a 
few_ private residences. 

•u~ E:nt.erprtaeL 
0AKLAHD COTTON M1LLS.-These mi lls are located on the 

San Antonio slough, and but a few yards from the eastem 
boun~ary line of the city of Oakland. The enterprise is 
justly regarded as one of the most important in California. 
The Company owning the mills was incorporated August 
25th, 1865, witfi' a capital stock of $100,000. The stock 
was held by W. H. Rector and his three sons, who were 
pioneers in the new branch of California industry, and who 
had gained a previous experience in Oregon. In January, 
18681 the capital was increased to $200,000, and it was 
determined to enlarge the sphere of the business by com­
mencing the manufacture of flax or jute into bagging. The 
experiments recently tried with Califomia flax have been 
quite successful. The present large two story brick build­
ing is to be enlarged and the name of the corporation was 
to be changed to the "Oakland Manufacturing and Spinnini 
Company." About a ton of flax is manufactured into fab­
rics daily, and fifty operatives find employment. Several 
skilled operatives from Dundee, Scotland, have been brought 
to the mills and a large number of Chinamen are worked 
under their supervision. There are forty looms, run by a 
forty-horse power steam engine. The undertaking has had 
many drawbacks, but has now become a source of profit. 
The working of cotton did not yield sufficient return, but 
the experiments with fla.x has been most gratifying, The 
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